EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT RENTAL: BID 280

RATE RATE
ITEM
numBer | QLY [DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES DAY A-WEEK 2-WEEK MONTHLY DAY A-WEEK 2-WEEK MONTHLY
1 1 |12 YARD DUMP TRUCK (INCLUDING OPERATOR/DRIVER) | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE
24 YARD DUMP TRAILER (INCLUDING
2 1 $ 640.00 | $ 4,480.00 | $ 8,960.00 | $ 17,920.00 NO BID
TRUCK/OPERATOR/DRIVER)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 30
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 30
18 YARD TRIAXLE DUMP TRAILER (INCLUDING
3 1 $ 560.00 | $ 3,920.00 | $ 7,840.00 | $ 15,680.00 NO BID
TRUCK/OPERATOR/DRIVER)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 26
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 26
40 TON LOWBOY TRAILER (INCLUDING
4 1 $ 760.00 | S 5,320.00 | $ 10,640.00 | $ 21,280.00 NO BID
TRUCK/OPERATOR/DRIVER)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 6
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 6
5 1 |TANKER FUEL/WATER (INCLUDING OPERATOR/DRIVER) $ 600.00 | S 4,200.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 16,800.00 NO BID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 5
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 5
6A 1 |FRONT END LOADER 2-1/4 YARD (INCLUDING OPERATOR) | $ 920.00 | $ 6,440.00 | $ 12,880.00 | $ 25,760.00 NO BID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 2
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 2
6B 1 |FRONT END LOADER 2-1/4 YARD ( WITHOUT OPERATOR) | $ 560.00 | $ 3,920.00 | $ 7,840.00 | $ 15,680.00 NO BID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 2
BACKHOE - RUBBER TIRE 590N EQUIVALENT (INCLUDING
7A 1 @ (INCLUDING S 640.00 | S 4,480.00 | $ 8,960.00 | $ 17,920.00 NO BID
OPERATOR)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 4
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 4
BACKHOE - RUBBER TIRE 590N EQUIVALENT (WITHOUT
7B 1 @ (WITHOUT S 400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 11,200.00 NO BID
OPERATOR)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 4
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH REGULAR REACH - CAT 225D
8 1 EQU|VALENT WITH MINIMUM 32“ BUCKET (INCLUDING s 880.00 s 6,160.00 s 12,320.00 s 24,640.00 NO BID
OPERATOR)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 15
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 15
NOTE: Supervision, mobilization and demobilization shall be included in the pricing of this bid.
* Quantity for bid purpose only. Page 1




EMERGENCY EQUIPMENT RENTAL: BID 280

RATE RATE
ITEM
NU_MBER *QTY |DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES DAY 1-WEEK 2-WEEK MONTHLY DAY 1-WEEK 2-WEEK MONTHLY
TRACK EXCAVATOR WITH LONG REACH - CAT 329D L
9 1 |EQUIVALENT WITH MINIMUM 24" BUCKET (INCLUDING | ® 1,150.00 [ 5 8,050.00 | 5 16,100.00 | 5 32,200.00 [ | NOBID
OPERATOR)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 2
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 2
MARSH ACCESSIBLE TYPE EXCAVATOR (INCLUDING
10 1 (INCLUDING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OPERATOR)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE
11 1 |DOZER - D4 EQUIVALENT (INCLUDING OPERATOR) $ 750.00 | ¢ 5,250.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 21,000.00 | | NOBID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 6
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 6
12 1 |DOZER - D8 EQUIVALENT (INCLUDING OPERATOR) $ 950.00 | ¢ 6,650.00 | $ 13,300.00 | $ 26,600.00 | | NOBID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 9
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 9
13A 1 |BOBCAT - T-870 EQUIVALENT (INCLUDING OPERATOR) $ 700.00 | ¢ 4,900.00 | ¢ 9,800.00 | ¢ 19,600.00 | | NOBID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 8
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 8
13B 1 |BOBCAT - T-870 EQUIVALENT (WITHOUT OPERATOR) $ 480.00 | ¢ 3,360.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 13,440.00 | | NOBID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 8
14 1 |16-17 TON TRUCK CRANE (INCLUDING OPERATOR) $ 1,200.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 33,600.00 | | NOBID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE 2
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE 2
15 1 |70 TON CRAWLER CRANE (INCLUDING OPERATOR) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE
NUMBER OF OPERATORS/DRIVERS AVAILABLE
16 1 |BOOMLIFT, 40" - 44', STRAIGHT, DIESEL, 4WD - GENIE $-40 | o gip NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 29452 | $ 763.38 | $ 1,526.76 | $ 1,718.43
EQUIVALENT (WITHOUT OPERATOR)
NUMBER OF UNITS AVAILABLE
NOTE: Supervision, mobilization and demobilization shall be included in the pricing of this bid.
* Quantity for bid purpose only. Page 2




